610 Franklin Street

Whitman, MA 02382

781-618-7417

john.stanbrook@whrsd.org

On Wed, Jan 31, 2024 at 4:01 PM Carter.Mary <MCarter@whitman-ma.gov> wrote:

Hi Jeff,

Great, thank you! | will update my budget number and look for John to confirm.

Thanks,

Mary Beth

Mary Beth Carter
Town Administrator
Town of Whitman

781-618-9704

From: Jeffrey Szymaniak <jeffrey.szymaniak@whrsd.org>

Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2024 3:59 PM

To: Carter.Mary <MCarter@whitman-ma.gov>

Cc: John Stanbrook <john.stanbrook@whrsd.org>; Keefe.Kathleen <KKeefe @whitman-ma.gov>
Subject: Re: Town of Whitman - FY 2025 Non-Mandated Busing

NOTI CE: EXTERNAL E- MAl L

This message originated outside of the Town of Whitman E-Mail system -- PLEASE DO NOT CLICK on links or
open attachments unless you are sure the content is safe.

- Technology Services

Hi Mary Beth,

It looks like $181,779 is the number for non-mandated in FY25. John can you confirm.

Thanks,

Jeff
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